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TRAVEL  

1. Tripit ‐  Get a master itinerary for every trip with all your travel plans in 
one place. Sign up for TripIt today. 

2. Weather + ‐ Very visual presentation of the weather. Very detailed weather 
information accompanied with a map and rain radar. 

3. Postagram ‐ Create postcards from the photos on your phone and send them 
to anybody, by mail! 

4. Google Translate ‐ Google Translate will translate whole paragraphs of text. 
You can say a phrase in English and it will repeat the words in a foreign 
language of your choice. 

5. Airbnb ‐ Rent unique accommodations from local hosts in over 190 
Countries. Feel at home anywhere you go in the world with airbnb. 

6. Beach Pro ‐ Surf Report 

7. SkyScanner ‐ SkyScanner is a great tool for travelers looking for the perfect 
deal on domestic and international flights. 

8. TripAdvisor ‐ A great travel guide and trip helper. 

9. XE Currency ‐ Convert every currency on‐the‐go with the XE Currency App 
for iPhone. 

10. Periscope ‐ Periscope lets you broadcast live video to the world. Gain 
followers to share your travel experiences. 

11. Duolingo ‐ Learn a new language on the go through engaging mini‐games 
that test your reading, writing, and speaking skills. 

12. Smart Traveler ‐ The official State Department app for US travelers, giving 
you country information, travel alerts, travel warnings, maps, US embassy 
locations, and more. 



13. Viber ‐ Send messages, make HD‐quality phone and video calls securly over 
WiFi. Communicate for free anywhere in the world. 

 

SOCIAL MEDIA  

1. Facebook ‐ Facebook is a social networking app that allows you to connect 
and share with your family and friends online. 

2. Skype ‐ Skype keeps the world talking. Call, message and share whatever 
you want for free. 

3. Pinterest ‐ A virtual pin board. It allows you to share and see other people’s 
“Pins.” You can upload and share photos with others. 

4. Twitter ‐ Network where users can share news or information. Usually, this 
is used to “Stay in the Loop.” 

5. Instagram ‐ Mainly a photo app that allows you to take photos within the 
app and share them with family and friends. 

6. LinkedIn ‐ Professional social media app. Network with co‐workers and 
clients to build relations and business. 

7. Voxer ‐ Voxer combines the power of live voice with text, video and photo 
sharing. 

 

PRODUCTIVITY  

1. Microsoft 

a. Word ‐ App that allows you to type documents. 

b. Excel ‐ App that allows you to create spreadsheets. 

c. PowerPoint ‐ App that allows you to create slide shows. 

d. OneDrive ‐ Microsoft Cloud Storage App (5GB Free) 

2. Apple 

a. Pages ‐ App that allows you to type documents. 



b. Numbers ‐ App that allows you to create spreadsheets. 

c. Keynote ‐ App that allows you to create slide shows. 

d. iCloud ‐ Apple's Cloud Storage (not an App) (5GB Free) 

3. Google 

a. Docs ‐ App that allows you to type documents. 

b. Sheets ‐ App that allows you to create spreadsheets. 

c. Slides ‐ App that allows you to create slide shows. 

d. Drive ‐ Google’s Cloud Storage (15GB Free) 

4. Dropbox ‐ Alternative cloud storage (2GB Free) 

5. GoodNotes ‐ A note taking app that allows you to write on the screen, mark, 
highlight, and draw on documents. 

6. TinyScan ‐ Turn photographs into PDF Documents. 

7. CalPrint ‐ Print your existing Calendar from your iPad by day, week, month, 
or custom to any printer. 

8. MyMail ‐ use myMail to manage messages in you Gmail, Hotmail, Live, 
Outlook, Yahoo, MSN, iCloud and AOL email accounts at once. 

9. Paper by FiftyThree ‐ Sketch, draw, take notes, make lists, diagram and 
wireframe. 

10. Evernote ‐ Note taking app that improves organization with notes, to‐do, 
and more. 

11. CamScanner ‐ Scan docs into clear & sharp image/PDF to email, fax, print 
or save to cloud. 

 

UTILITY  

1. QR Code Reader by Scan ‐ QR Code Reader is a scanner that scans and 
processes QR codes. 

2. Bubble Level ‐ A level on your iPhone or iPad. 



3. 5‐0 Radio Police Scanner ‐ Live police, firefighter, aircraft, railroad, 
marine, emergency, and ham radio feed. 

4. Star Chart ‐ Astronomy app that shows stars and planets along with 
information about each star and planet. 

5. Calculator​‰​ ‐ A simple calculator with big numbers and print. 

6. Compass ‐ A simple compass with large print. 

7. TuneIn Radio ‐ Listen to your favorite radio stations for free. Over 100,000 
radio stations. 

8. Battery HD+ ‐ A detailed battery monitor. 

9. Google ‐ The best of Google in one app. 

10. Google Maps ‐ A comprehensive map and information tool about different 
spots in town. 

11. Passbook (iPhone only) ‐ Keep your boarding passes, movie tickets, retail 
coupons, and loyalty cards in one place. 

12. iExit ‐ App that helps you decide where to take pitstops when traveling US 
interstates. 

13. GasBuddy ‐ Find cheap gas prices at fuel stations nearby. 

14. ZEDGE Walpapers ‐ Easy to use wallpaper app to personalize your home or 
lock screen. 

15. WiFi Map ‐ The largest Wi‐Fi community in App Store. Freehotspots, 
passwords and comments from real people! 

16. Photomath ‐ Point your camera toward a math problem and Photomath will 
magically show the result with a detailed step‐by‐step solution. 

17. 1Passowrd ‐ App that remembers all your passwords and other sensitive 
information so you don’t have to. 

 

ENTERTAINMENT  

1. Netflix ‐ Watch TV episodes and movies on your phone or tablet. 



2. Fandango ‐ Movie ticket app. 

3. Kindle ‐ Get access to more than 3 million books and audiobooks. 

4. Cheese! ‐ take funny pictures. 

5. PBS Video ‐ Watch the most popular programs from PBS. 

6. Golf Live Extra ‐ Watch live PGA Tour golf from you iOS devices. 

7. Flixter ‐ App to find movie reviews, watch trailers, and get showtimes. 

8. Shazam ‐ App that listens to music and identifies it, as well as, gets song 
lyrics, and helps you discover music. 

9. Downcast ‐ Easy to use podcast player that will help you manage and listen 
to podcasts the way you want to. 

10. Crackle ‐ Ad supported, free movie watching app with hundreds of films and 
TV shows. 

11. Procreate ‐ Most powerful sketching, painting and illustration app ever 
designed for a mobile device. 

12. Spotify ‐ Listen to your favorite music whenever you have access to the 
internet. 

13. YouTube ‐ Watch channels created by users. Learn something new, or 
create your own channel. 

14. Pandora ‐ Internet radio that will automatically select songs that you would 
be interested in. 

 

FOOD AND DRINK  

1. Allrecipes Dinner Spinner ‐ Amazing collection of member shared recipes, 
photos, ratings, and reviews from a community of more than 30 million 
home cooks. 

2. Zomato ‐ #1 free app dedicated to helping you find the best food and dining 
experience at over a million restaurants. 



3. Smith’s ‐ The Smith’s mobile app puts convenience and savings at your 
fingertips. 

4. Epicurious ‐ More than 35,000 high quality recipes.  

5. Cheese and Wine ‐ Wine expert guides help you pick the perfect matches. 

 

HEALTH & FITNESS  

1. MyFitnessPal ‐ The fastest and easiest to use calorie counter for iOS. 

2. WebMD ‐ Offers physician‐reviewed health content and interactive tools in 
addition to on‐demand healthy living information. 


